



May 03, 2017

NOTICE OF AWARD

Color 1 Digital, Inc.
2321 Marconi St., San Isidro
Makati City, Metro Manila

Dear **Sir/Madam**:

This is to notify you that your quotation for the printing and delivery of five thousand (5,000) pcs. Business Cards and five hundred (500) copies of "Medium Term Policy & System Research Agenda" brochure in the amount of thirty four thousand pesos (PhP 34,000.00), is hereby approved.

You are required to deliver the items within twelve (12) working days from the receipt of the approved Work Order (W.O.) and print-out and /or blue- print.

In case of failure to make full delivery within the time specified, a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one percent for every day of delay shall be imposed.

Very truly yours,


JAIME C. MONTOYA, MD, MSc., PhD, CESO III
Executive Director

BAC Resolution Declaring LCRB and Recommending Approval

RESOLUTION NO. 15-17

WHEREAS, the Philippine Council for Health Research and Development (PCHRD) posted the Request for Quotations in the Philgeps and in the PCHRD websites on April 18 to 21, 2017 for the printing and delivery of the following:

- a. Business Card**
 - Size: 3" x 2.5"
 - Color: Full Color (front and back) printing
 - Stock: C2S 220 lbs with matte lamination
 - Quantity: 5,000 pcs. (for 25 staff, 200 pcs./staff)
 - ABC = PHP 25,000.00

- b. Notebook**
 - Size: A5 (final trim)
 - Stock: Cover – Pasteboard #20, C2S 120 with Matte Lamination with Spot UV
Inside – Special Paper (edición white) 120 gsm
 - Color: Full Color, All pages
 - No. of pages: 100 leaves
 - Binding: Hardbound and spiral binding
 - Quantity: 1,000 pcs.
 - ABC = PHP 230,000.00

- c. Folder (9" x 12" + 0.2" spine)**
 - Size: 9" x 12" + 0.2" Spine plus 4" pocket
 - Stock: Foldcote Cal 20
 - Color: Full Color
 - Printing: Front, Back and Inside printing
 - Lamination: Matte Lamination with Spot UV (both sides)
 - Others: with Die Cut and Pasting
 - Quantity: 1,000 pcs.
 - ABC = PHP 75,000.00

- d. Folder (A4 size)**
 - Size: A4
 - Stock: Translucent, Plastic Material
 - Color: Full Color (Front and Back)
 - Quantity: 1,000 pcs.
 - ABC = PHP 70,000.00

- e. Notepad (5.5" x 8")**
 - Size: 5.5" x 8"
 - Stock: Bookpaper 60 lbs
 - Color: Full Color (one side print)
 - Quantity: 1,000 pcs.
 - ABC = PHP 50,000.00

f. Medium Term Policy & System Research Agenda

- Size: 6" x 9" (Folded), 12" x 9" (Spread)
- Cover: C2S 220, full color
- No. of Pages: 28 pp.
- Lamination: Matte Lamination
- Binding: Saddle Stitch
- Quantity: 500 pcs.
- ABC = PHP 50,000.00

WHEREAS, in response to the said posting/advertisement, six (6) printing firms submitted their offers before the opening of quotations on April 21, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.;

WHEREAS, the following are the quoted amount of the six firms:

Name of Printing Firms	Offered Amount					
	Business Card	Notebook	Folder (9"x12")	Folder (A4 size, plastic)	Notepad	Brochure
Best Shot Printing	28,500.00	165,000.00 (100 gsm)	50,000.00	No bid	32,000.00	37,000.00
Colorplus Production Group	25,000.00	229,000.00	67,000.00	No bid	32,000.00	42,000.00
King Phil Printing Press	22,400.00	178,200.00	59,800.00	No bid	43,200.00	39,600.00
Erzalan Printing Press	16,300.00	183,000.00	61,450.00	60,000.00	43,500.00	42,185.00
Printquest Inc.	17,500.00	198,000.00	44,000.00	No bid	31,000.00	37,500.00
Color1 Digital, Inc.	12,000.00	No bid	44,000.00	No bid	39,000.00	22,000.00

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification of all the submitted quotations, one (1) offer for the 1st item exceeded the ABC while all others have been found to be responsive;

NOW, therefore, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVED as it is RESOLVED;

- a) To declare **Color1 Digital, Inc.**, as the printing firm with the Lowest Calculated and Responsive offer for printing and delivery of 5,000 pcs. business cards and 500 pcs. Medium Term Policy & System Research Agenda Brochure; **King Phil Printing Press** for 1,000 pcs. notebook; **Printquest Inc.** for 1,000 pcs. folder (9"x12"x0.2" spine) and 1,000 pcs. notepad; and **Erzalan Printing Press** for 1,000 pcs. folder (A4 size plastic);
- b) To recommend for approval by the Executive Director of PCHRD the foregoing findings.

RESOLVED, at the PCHRD office this 3rd day of May, 2017.



ROSELLE L. MARTONITO

Chair, BAC



LUCILA E. ROJA

Vice-Chair, BAC



MYLENE B. MARCO

BAC member



BUENALIVIA N. OLATAN

BAC member



PEARL KATHLEEN C. TUMLOS

BAC member



WILMA I. SANTOS

BAC member

Approved:



JAIME C. MONTOYA, MD, MSc., PhD, CESO III

Executive Director/Head of the Procuring Entity (HOPE)